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Check the appropriate box below if the Form 8-K filing is intended to simultaneously satisfy the filing obligation of the registrant under any of the following
provisions:
 

☐ Written communications pursuant to Rule 425 under the Securities Act (17 CFR 230.425)
 

☐ Soliciting material pursuant to Rule 14a-12 under the Exchange Act (17 CFR 240.14a-12)
 

☐ Pre-commencement communications pursuant to Rule 14d-2(b) under the Exchange Act (17 CFR 240.14d-2(b))
 

☐ Pre-commencement communications pursuant to Rule 13e-4(c) under the Exchange Act (17 CFR 240.13e-4(c))
   



Item 2.03 Creation of a Direct Financial Obligation or an Obligation under an Off-Balance Sheet Arrangement of a Registrant.

On March 7, 2013, ON Semiconductor Corporation (the “Company”) entered into a privately negotiated exchange agreement (the “Exchange Agreement”) with a
certain holder (the “Exchanging Holder”) of its 2.625% Convertible Senior Subordinated Notes due 2026 (the “Old Notes”). Pursuant to the terms of the
Exchange Agreement, the Exchanging Holder will exchange (the “Exchange”) $60,000,000 aggregate principal amount of Old Notes held by the Exchanging
Holder for $58,500,000 aggregate principal amount of the Company’s 2.625% Convertible Senior Subordinated Notes due 2026, Series B (the “New Notes”),
plus accrued and unpaid interest on the Old Notes. The New Notes will be an additional issuance under the Indenture (the “Indenture”) dated as of December 15,
2011, by and among the Company, Deutsche Bank Trust Company Americas, as trustee (“Trustee”), and the subsidiary guarantors (“Subsidiary Guarantors”)
listed therein. Deutsche Bank Trust Company Americas is also the trustee under the Indenture for the Old Notes.

The Exchange is subject to certain conditions, including the effectiveness of the Company and Subsidiary Guarantors’ Application for Qualification on Form T-3
filed with the Securities and Exchange Commission (“SEC”) on March 7, 2013 (the “Form T-3”). A form of the Exchange Agreement was filed with the Form T-
3 and the Indenture was filed with the Company’s Current Report on Form 8-K filed with the SEC on December 19, 2011.

The New Notes will accrue interest at a rate of 2.625% per annum. Interest on the New Notes is payable in cash semi-annually in arrears on June 15 and
December 15 of each year, beginning on June 15, 2013. The maturity date of the New Notes is December 15, 2026. With the exception of certain provisions
regarding the timing of optional redemption of the New Notes by the Company, the timing of repurchase of the New Notes at the option of the holder and the
timing of a holder’s ability to convert the New Notes, as well as the number of additional shares that may be issuable upon conversion in connection with a
fundamental change, the terms of the Indenture and the New Notes are substantially similar to the terms of the Old Notes and the indenture relating to the Old
Notes. The material differences between the Old Notes and the New Notes are set out under “Summary of Material Differences Between the Outstanding Notes
and the New Notes” in Exhibit A-2 to the Form of Exchange Agreement filed with the Form T-3.

Subject to the terms of the Indenture, holders will have the right to convert the New Notes into cash and shares of the Company’s common stock at any time on or
after June 15, 2016 and upon the occurrence of certain specified events described in the Indenture prior to June 15, 2016, in each case, at a conversion rate of
95.2381 shares of common stock per $1,000 aggregate principal amount of New Notes (equivalent to a conversion price of approximately $10.50 per share),
subject to adjustment. If specified “fundamental changes” described in the Indenture occur prior to December 15, 2016, the Company will increase the conversion
rate for a holder who elects to convert its notes in connection with such fundamental change upon conversion in certain circumstances. The additional shares to be
issued are based on a table attached to the Indenture calculated on the basis of the closing price of the Company’s common stock of $8.04 on December 2, 2011.
No adjustment will be made if the common stock price on the effective date of the fundamental change is greater than $50.00 or less than $8.04. In no event will
the shares of common stock issuable upon such conversion exceed 124.3781 per $1,000 principal amount of the New Notes, subject to adjustment.

Holders may require the Company to repurchase all or a portion of their notes for cash at a repurchase price equal to 100% of the principal amount of the New
Notes on December 15 of 2016 and 2021, plus accrued and unpaid interest to, but excluding, the repurchase date. If a designated event (deemed to have occurred
upon a fundamental change or a termination of trading) occurs prior to the maturity date of the New Notes, the holders may require the Company to repurchase all
or part of their New Notes at a repurchase price equal to 100% of the principal amount, plus accrued and unpaid interest to, but excluding, the repurchase date.

Beginning on December 20, 2016, the Company may redeem the New Notes, in whole or in part, for cash at a price of 100% of the principal amount plus accrued
and unpaid interest to, but excluding, the redemption date.

If an event of default occurs and continues, the Trustee or the holders of at least 25% in principal amount of the outstanding New Notes may declare 100% of the
principal amount of and accrued and unpaid interest on the



outstanding New Notes to be immediately due and payable. In case of certain events of bankruptcy or insolvency involving the Company or any significant
subsidiary, the principal amount of the New Notes will automatically become due and payable. However, if the Company cures all defaults, except the
nonpayment of principal that became due as a result of the acceleration, and meets certain other conditions, this declaration may be cancelled and the holders of a
majority of the principal amount of outstanding New Notes may waive these past defaults.
 
Item 3.02 Unregistered Sales of Equity Securities.

The disclosure set forth in Item 2.03 of this Current Report on Form 8-K is incorporated herein by reference. The New Notes will be issued to the Exchanging
Holder pursuant to the exemption from the registration requirements of the Securities Act of 1933, as amended, contained in Section 3(a)(9) thereof on the basis
that the Exchange constitutes an exchange with existing holders of the Company’s securities and no commission or other remuneration has been or will be paid by
the Company or the Subsidiary Guarantors, directly or indirectly, for soliciting the Exchange.
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